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The Manchurian violet is a flower that has been 
popular for centuries, with numerous species 
native to the city. Along with other related 
species such as pansies and violas, it is often 
found growing in decorative flower beds around 
the city. It was chosen as a city flower with the 
hope that the beautiful Manchurian violets all 
throughout the city will serve as a fresh, new 
source of  attraction.

City Flower

Japanese Iris

This flower has a refined beauty, with bluish-
purple petals and blade-like leaves. It has long 
been widely known as a symbol of  the area due 
to its association with Ayame Gozen and the 
Genji Ayame Festival, both of  which have connec-
tions to the city.

City Tree

Asian Bayberry

Mention of  this tree can be found in folklore 
concerning Minamoto no Yoritomo and Hojo 
Masako, both of  whom have connections to the 
city, and thus has deep significance for the 
citizens of  Izunokuni. Its leaves are notoriously 
difficult to tear from the side, and this is 
symbolic of  the strong bonds between the city’s 
government and citizens as they work together, 
unified, to ensure its continued development.
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